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Bid Minutes 
20160209 INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY 

Facilities Building Airport Road 
 
Sealed Bids were opened on February 9, 2016 at 10:00 a.m. at the Larry Riggsbee Facilities Building, 
1500 Airport Road, Gallatin, TN for 20160209 INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY. 
 
Present for the bid opening were: 
 
Chris Harrison – Sumner County Board of Education 
Christie Binion – Sumner County Board of Education 
Kristy Oran – Technology Express 
 
We received bid responses from the following companies: 
 
Technology Express 
1700 Oak Hills Drive 
Kingston, TN 37763 
 
Camcor Inc. 
2273 South Church Street 
Burlington, NC 27215 
 
CDWG 
230 N Milwaukee Avenue 
Vernon Hills, IL 60061 
  



TECHNOLOGY EXPRESS CAMCOR INC. CDWG
ITEM 1

Price $2,999.00 NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer Double Robotics

Model Double 2
Warranty 1 year
Help Desk Vendor
Discount 10%

ITEM 2
Price $3,599.00 NO BID NO BID

Manufacturer HP
Model K5H59A8

Warranty 3 year
Help Desk Vendor
Discount 10%

ITEM 3
Price $1,399.00 $1,340.72 $963.00 / $1,113.00 / $3,850.00

Manufacturer SMART 



ITEM 6
Price $599.00 $532.55 $525.00  Optional Module $79.00

Manufacturer Epson and Universal Mount Epson Epson
Model V11H687020 / CMJ500R1 / AEC00600 98H (#V11H687020) PL98H

Warranty 3 year 2 year 3 year
Help Desk Vendor Vendor Manufacturer
Discount 10% 5% 5%

*Includes Projector 



ITEM 11
Price $2,689.99 $2,651.50 $2,780.00

Manufacturer Makerbot Makerbot MakerBot
Model Replicator 5th Generation Desktop Replicator (#MP05825) Replicator 5th Gen

Warranty 1 year 1 year MakerCare Protection Plan 1 year
Help Desk Vendor Vendor Manufacturer
Discount 10% 5% 5%

*Install & Orientation 372

ITEM 12
Price $193.99 NO BID $225.00 / $247.00

Manufacturer Brother Brother / HP
Model HLπ5450DN HLπL6200DW / M402DN

Warranty 1 year 1 year
Help Desk Vendor Manufacturer
Discount 10% 5%

*Install & Orientation $372

ITEM 13
Price $1,189.00 NO BID $595.00 / $547.00

Manufacturer HP Brother / HP
Model CC490A HLL9200CDWT / M553N

Warranty 1 year 1 year
Help Desk Vendor Manufacturer
Discount 10% 5%

*Install & Orientation $372

ITEM 14
Price $389.00 (Brother) $329.00 (Lexmark) NO BID $315.00 / $385.00

Manufacturer Brother / Lexmark Brother / HP
Model HLπL8350CDW / CS310N HLL825OCDN / M553N

Warranty 1 year 1 year
Help Desk Vendor Manufacturer
Discount 10% 5%

*Install & Orientation $372

*Installation pricing is inflated due to the request
that it be presented in a oneπoff per unit price.
More accurate pricing can be provided on a 
project level basis.

**Cable kits for projector installs: $480

***Cable run: $420
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