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BEECH HIGH FOOTBALL FIELD

Home Side - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Visitor Side - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Misc. Additional Fees - Ground Start
GRAND TOTAL - Ground Start

Home Side - Elevated
Seating Capacity

Visitor Side - Elevated
Seating Capacity

Misc. Additional Fees - Elevated
GRAND TOTAL - Elevated

WHITE HOUSE HIGH FOOTBALL FIELD

Home Side - Ground Start
Misc. Additional Fees

GRAND TOTAL - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Home Side - Elevated
Misc. Additional Fees
GRAND TOTAL - Elevated
Seating Capacity

B&K Rentals and Sales Co., Inc.

Production Management One, Inc.

Option 1 Option 2
$43,660.00 $43,365.00 $216,480.00
1,482 1,472 1,744
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $74,400.00
564 576 572
0 0 $53,590.00
$60,275.00 $60,334.00 $344,470.00
NO BID NO BID $189,760.00
1,348
NO BID NO BID $76,720.00
572
NO BID NO BID $59,440.00
$325,920.00
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $108,375.00
0 0 $27,640.00
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $136,015.00
564 576 528
NO BID NO BID $88,560.00
0 0 $24,610.00
0 0 $113,170.00
564 576 408
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